
"THERE WAS NEVER AN EGO CALLED ''YOU''

When you choose to join with the Holy Spirit, you break the intent to see 
the Kingdom of Heaven with a little bit of torque applied to it. And you 
break the obsession of maintaining the torque, the bias. You therefore 
abandon the personal power that you believe is inseparable from your 
identity, meaning the definitions you have given yourself. And in the 
willingness to abandon those, there is a spontaneous movement of 
rejoining, of reconnection, if you will, with your Source, that returns your 
experience of your Real Identity to you and you discover that it just 
wasn't so. There never was an ego called "you". And there never was this 
fantastic conglomeration of false definitions that constituted you living in 
a world that had nothing to do with God. Awakening is really the undoing 
of the belief that you really became something other than what God is 
forever being new.

Now, you did not create the world. You only created the definitions that 
you're applying to the world. And so everything will NOT disappear. 
Creation will be recognizable to you as Creation, instead of quote "the 
world and universe" that was constituted of the best definitions you could 
come up with. And so this is not going to constitute a loss of any sort. 
Everything that you see will become illumined with the Truth of what it is. 
And so everything that you see will in that process of becoming 
illuminated to you, will take on more meaning--awesome meaning. Its 
divinity that would warrant the hosannas of the angels will register with 
you and make your Soul soar and sing with joy in the recognition of the 
exquisiteness of what God be's.

And so this is why I keep saying ask, "What is the Truth here?" And let 
your energy and your interest and your attention be turned to the Holy 
Spirit with the question, "What is the Truth here?" so that the delight of 
experiencing the Truth being revealed to you might be had by you.
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